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ITEMNO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY (O] < 0 Oa O o n
1 ea.
15,000 GVWR (minimum) 4 door, crew cab truck with mounted fiberglass utility UNIT PRICE *
body, complete, per specifications TOTAL 54,307.32 59,845.00 NO BID
A. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2012 Ford F450 Ford F450 Crew Cab
5 ea. *
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short bed (no outside fenders), extended, UNIT PRICE 20,767.00 20,776.00 22,978.55
club, super cab pickup truck, complete, per specifications TOTAL 103,835.00 103,880.00 114,892.75
B. State Make and Model makemopeL | 2012 Ford F150 Super Cab Ford F150 4x2 Chev. CC10753
4 ea. *
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short bed (no outside fenders), extended, club  [uniT price 25,261.00 24,981.00 27,630.15
super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 101,044.00 99,924.00 110,520.60
C. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2012 Ford F150 Super Cab Ford F150 4x4 Chev. CK10753
1ea.
9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and long type bed (no fender outside) UNIT PRICE *
crew cab/quad cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL 38,883.00 38,340.00 NO BID
D. State Make and Model makemopeL | 2012 Ford F250 Crew Cab Ford F250 4x4
lea.
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short bed (no outside fenders), extended, club  [uniT Price *
super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 26,537.00 26,186.00 NO BID
E. State Make and Model vakenvopel | 2012 Ford F150 Super Cab [Ford F150 Super Cab)
1lea. *
5,700 GVWR, 4x2, 4 door sport utility type vehicle complete, per specifications UNIT PRICE 24,999.00 22,786.00 27,495.40
TOTAL 274,989.00 250,646.00 302,449.40
F. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 Ford Explorer Ford Explorer Chev.
2ea. *
5,700 GVWR, 4x4, 4 door sport utility type vehicle, complete, per specifications UNIT PRICE 25,844.00 38,326.01
TOTAL NO BID 51,688.00 76,652.02
G. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford Explorer 4x4 Chev. CK10706
lea.
6,700 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) club, UNIT PRICE *
crew cab/quad cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL 33,295.00 32,586.00 NO BID
H. State Make and Model vakevopel | 2012 Ford F150 Crew Cab  |Ford F150 Super Cab)
lea.
9,300 GVWR (minimum) single rear wheel, 2x4 regular cab truck with installed UNIT PRICE *
service body, complete, per specifications TOTAL 28,581.00 26,944.00 NO BID
State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2012 Ford F250 Reg. Cab Ford F250
lea.
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short bed (no outside fenders), club *
crew cab pickup truck, per specifcations 27,977.00 28,146.00 NO BID
J. State Make and Model 2012 Ford F150 Crew Cab | Ford F140 Super Cab
Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 75-135 days 120 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alamo Toyota Holiday Ford Demandstar
Ancira Motor Co. Jennings Anderson Ford SAWS Website

Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge
Brown Chevrolet

Caldwell Country Ford
Cavender Chevrolet
Columbus Country

Dodge Superstor

Grande Ford

Jordan Ford
Planet Ford

Red McCombs Dodge

Red McCombs Toyota/Ford
Southway Ford

Tom Benson Chevrolet
Universal Toyota




